
3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

TN0330100

17 S Moore Rd20-026561 3/16/2020  12:45:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/16/2020 at 00:50 hours, Officer K Hughes (0062192) reported a memo at 17 S. Moore Rd.  Mother, Dr. Mary Paris said her 
son, Cory Paris, was knocking on her door and messing wither windows, trying to get. She said she did not want him there, but he 
would not leave. I spoke to Mr. Paris while he leaned back on the porch's balusters and yelled to his mom through the side door. I 
told him to cut his act, and leave. "I'm just making sure my mom's OK. I love her," he continued. After suggesting he could 
reassure the judge how much he loved his mother after being arrested for Criminal Trespasing, he decided it was better to just 
leave. He got into his white vehicle backed up to the back yard's rear fence. Ms. Shannon Johnson was also sitting in the back 
seat of this car. I watched them drive off.  No further.

2039 Ruby St20-026577 3/16/2020   2:02:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 02:05 hours, Officer Cronon (82256) reported a memo at 2039 Ruby St. Police received a call for a suspicious 
person outside of the residence of the above address in her yard, could hear knocking and she could hear a male talking, but could
not see anyone. Police got on scene and saw Mr. Davis walking in the roadway in front of the above address. Mr. Davis stated he 
is from Alabama, was knocking on the door of the residence because he used to have friends that lived there. Mr. Davis was given 
a ride to his aunt's house at 2255 E. 25th St. Ct. by 3B5 (Officer Menendez). Nothing further.

3916 6th Ave20-026583 3/16/2020   2:39:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 02:45 hours, Officer M. Recaido #965 was dispatched to 3916 6th Ave. for a disorder. Upon arrival, I met with 
Ms. Tasha Pickett who stated that she and Ernest a black male, were in an argument in the front yard. Ms. Pickett's daughter 

) thought her mother was in trouble and scared for her, so she called the police. The other party(Ernest) had left the 
scene before police arrived. No other information could be found at the time of the incident. There were no signs of distress nor 
any visual physical harm. No further police action was taken.

2210 Bams Dr20-026591 3/16/2020   3:50:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/16/2020 at 03:53 hours, Officer Williams (63838) reported a memo at 2210 Bams Dr. Upon arrival police spoke to Sarah 
Pugh. Ms. Pugh stated that there was a Hispanic female in the parking lot acting suspicious. Ms. Pugh stated that the female was 
pacing the parking lot lifting her shirt up and down. Police canvassed the area but were unable to locate any female, or suspicious 
activity. No further.

2300 Wilson St20-026592 3/16/2020   3:45:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/16/2020 at 03:45 hours, Officer M. Dagostino (82257) conducted a field interview at 2300 Wilson St. I made contact with a 
suspicious party on foot at this address who reported she just got out of jail and was looking for her daughter who recently moved 
to the area. I identified this party as Ms. Stokes. A warrant check was conducted showing no active warrants. Ms. Stokes left the 
area on foot without incident. Nothing further to report.

3824 Wauchula St20-026601 3/16/2020   5:28:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/16/2020 at 05:31  hours, I Officer Mulenga Teddy #894 responded to a disorder at 3824 Wauchula St. 

         Upon arrival, I made contact with Eboni Provost who informed me that she and her boyfriend Dominique Parks got into a 
heated argument regarding other women and other topics. Eboni stated that the argument had not gotten physical at any point and
that Eboni just wanted Dominique out of her residence. I spoke to Dominique separately and he confirmed the same information. 
Both parties' information was run in the system and came back negative for warrants. Eboni and Dominique went their separate 
ways nothing further follows.



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

101 N Crest Rd20-026603 3/16/2020   5:35:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/16/2020 at 05:44 hours, Officer M. Dagostino (82257) responded to a suspicious vehicle at 101  N Crest Rd. Police were 
dispatched with a report of a car stopped at the intersection of N Crest Rd and Shallowford Rd with an occupant behind the wheel 
possibly asleep. I made contact with the driver of a Gray Buick Sedan (TN: temp tag) Mr. Robinson slumped over the steering 
wheel. Mr. Robinson woke up and informed me he fell asleep behind the wheel and reported this had happened to him two days 
ago in GA. Mr. Robinson reported he has a heart condition but declined medical attention. Mr. Robinson agreed to do field sobriety
testing on scene. While conducting field sobriety testing I did not observe any signs of impairment. Mr. Robinson called a friend 
and had them pick him up and drive his vehicle for him while police stayed on scene. Nothing further to report.

2495 Bridge Cir20-026604 3/16/2020   5:43:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 03/16/2020 at 08:08 hours, Officer Hamilton (66984) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 2495 
Bridge Cir. I spoke to Mr. Newman on the phone and he wanted to add that a green sticker was on the front windshield. He said 
the sticker was a "Tracen Yorktown" student parking sticker. There is nothing further to report.

1330 E 3rd St20-026622 3/16/2020   7:52:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/16/2020 at 07:54 hours, Officer Clemons #827 at responded to a suspicious party at 1330 E 3rd St. Prior to arrival I was 
informed by dispatch that the suspect in question was a B/M wearing sweatpants, blue jacket and white shoes. I was able to locate 
the party in question, later found out to be Mr. Jimmy Butts. I told Mr. Butts that he needed to leave the premises and to not return 
because the Speedway requested that he be added to the no trespass list. No further

806 Merriam St20-026635 3/16/2020   9:15:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 09:30 hours, Officer Lorin Johnston (042491) reported a memo at 806 Merriam St. The unknown caller from 
Florida wanted police to check on a W/M David Picket. We spoke to Pickett and he said he was fine, and that he has never been 
suicidal and won't be. No further.

7630 E Brainerd Rd20-026652 3/16/2020  10:10:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 10:17 hours, Officer Baker (79856) reported a memo at 7630 E Brainerd Rd.  I spoke with Mrs. Clayton who 
stated that a white short bus was driving erratically and seemed to be road ragging.  The driver of the bus was a white male in his 
50's.  Mrs. Clayton pulled over to a parking lot to call police and the white bus also pulled into the lot.  Upon seeing Mrs. Clayton on
the phone the driver of the bus left without incident, nothing further.
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3929 Manor Rd20-026671 3/16/2020  11:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 11:15 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 3929 Manor Rd. Police made contact with manager 
Jessica Craig. Jessica stated that they were renovating a room when they noticed several items that appeared to be very dirty. 
Jessica and her crew threw the items in the dumpster and later watched an African American male walk over to the dumpster and 
retrieve some items. Jessica stated that she believed the male was squatting inside the apartment. She stated that she would call 
back if he returned. No further.

4107 10th Ave20-026676 3/16/2020  11:17:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 03/27/2020 at 16:51  hours, Officer Willis (61920) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 
4107 10th Ave. The stolen tag ) was found to be on a Nissan Altima that was parked in the parking lot of the Studio 6 
Motel located at 7324 Shallowford Rd. The tag was taken off the vehicle, taken out of NCIC (#P147139843) and turned into CPD 
Property division.

No further at this time.

218 Gillespie Rd20-026677 3/16/2020  11:00:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 03/16/2020 at 10:31  hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Vandalism at 218 Gillespie Rd. 

I spoke with Cathy Patrick by phone.  She says this morning, she found red paint down the left side of her 2014 Chevrolet Cruse.  
She says she does not know who did this or why.

224 Frazier Ave20-026701 3/16/2020  12:10:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 03/16/2020 at 17:40 hours, Officer J. Boucher-Moilien (82274) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle 
at 224 Frazier Ave. Vehicle, one Mitsubishi Galant, was recovered at 505 Haymore Ave. Vehicle  with VIN 
4A3AB46F55E050711  was taken out of NCIC on 03/16/2020 at 1742 hours. Owner Victor Lingerfelt was notified by phone that his 
vehicle was towed by Johnnys Wrecker Service to 6809 Conner Ln and can be contacted at . Mr. Lingerfelt stated he 
had no questions. Mr. Lingerfelt was notified the recovery report will be added to the original report if he needs a copy. Keys not 
with vehicle. No further police action needed at this time.

480 Greenway View Dr20-026705 3/16/2020  11:00:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 03/16/2020 at 14:25 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) responded to a Shoplifting at 480 Greenway View Dr. Upon police arrival, 
police spoke with Tameka Avery. Tameka stated to police that she witnessed a white female (506, 350, blonde) conceal a Citi 
Trends shirt inside her undershirt. The female then passed all points of store sales without paying for the merchandise. The female 
then got inside a Kia and drove away from the scene. The suspect had another female with her, but this female did not take 
anything away from the store. Police will update this report with any new information.

5505 Brainerd Rd20-026713 3/16/2020  12:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/16/2020 at 13:00 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 5505 Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival, police spoke with 
employee Jason Sanford. Jason stated that there were 2 guests who they wanted removed from the property for smoking in a non 
smoking room. Police made contact with Tammy Hankins and Shane Zamora. Both parties were negative for warrants, 
trespassed, and told to vacate the premises and not return.

5756 Highway 15320-026723 3/16/2020   2:00:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/16/2020 at 13:30 hours, Officer Nelson (75393) reported a memo at 5756 Highway 153. Police responded to Burkes Outlet 
store on reports of someone dumping into their trash bin. Police responded to the incident location and observed several bags of 
house hold garbage with one bag having a pill bottle at the top of the bag. The bottle had the name Shannon Kelly Leiper as the 
prescribed person. Police could observe no other information at this time. No video evidence exists and no solid suspect 
information is available at this time.

7622 Bonnie Dr20-026756 3/16/2020   3:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 21:34 hours, Officer N. Gurnsey (79875) conducted a follow up at 7622 Bonnie Dr. Day Shift Charlie North 
officers responded to 7622 Bonnie Dr. at approximately 1517 hours on 3/16/20 in regard to people illegally occupying a 
condemned building.  Second shift officers responded to the property.  The main building on the lot was secure.  there was no 
answer at the door and no signs of movement within.  Out buildings on the property were unoccupied at the time of Police 
presence.

1713 E 35th St20-026784 3/16/2020   4:56:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 16:20 hours, Officer Bulkley (68389) and PO Pierre (84860) were dispatched to 1713 E 35th St/Smart Auto to 
speak with complainant Willie Wooten. Mr. Wooten stated that a vehicle owned by Smart Auto had been located at LKQ Pick Your 
Part/400 Workman Rd although Smart Auto did not sell that vehicle to them. Mr. Wooten stated that when he requested 
information on who sold them the vehicle the employees stated that they could only release that information to the police. I then 
went to LKQ Pick Your Part to retrieve the seller information. Upon arrival to LKQ I spoke with Mr. Dillon Young who stated that the 
car was purchased from Credit Cars/1501  E 27th St. I then went to Credit Cars to inquire about the vehicle and met with Michael 
Mack (employee). Mr. Mack stated that he has only been working there for a few months and that he did not know about this 
specific vehicle. Mr. Mack stated that he would contact the owner (Mike Brock) and inquire about where the vehicle was purchased
from. At this time the vehicle was not being reported stolen however I passed along the aforementioned info to Mr. Wooten. No 
further action was needed at this time. 
Vehicle- 2005 White Buick Lacrosse
VIN-2G4C532351303969

1201 Boynton Dr20-026805 3/16/2020   3:22:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 15:25 hours, Officer T. PLUNKETT (079536) reported a memo at 1201  Boynton Dr. 
While on an unrelated call Management observed a hispanic female and stated that she did not live at the above address and 
wanted her banned from the property. The female is identified as Ms. Irma Mendoza . She was 
made aware that she is no longer to be back on the property as of 3/16/2020 at 1638 hours. Nothing further at this time.
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7734 Lee Hwy20-026837 3/16/2020   5:45:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 03/16/2020 at 17:50 hours, Officer Johnston (75394) responded to a Shoplifting at 7734 Lee Hwy. On scene I spoke with the 
complainant ( MR. Palacio) who stated that a white male was observed on camera reaching over the counter where some 
electronic games were stored. In the video you can see the suspect reach over the counter but you can not see him take anything 
at this time and the complainant stated that he would not be able to give an inventory of those items at this time. Nothing else 
follows at this time.

5510 Highway 15320-026899 3/16/2020   8:00:00PM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery

On 03/16/2020 at 20:25 hours, Sergeant Robert Bell #234 (62177) responded to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 5510 Highway 153. 
Ms. Jordan Wilson, of Little Caesar's, flagged this officer down regarding a $50 bill that they believed to be counterfeit. The bill did 
look suspicious in quality. The business wished to file a report and the bill was submitted to CPD Property on 03/16/20 at 2140 
hours. Nothing further.

7310 Standifer Gap Rd20-026902 3/16/2020   8:32:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 03/18/2020 at 06:03 hours, Officer Dyess (83681) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 7310 
Standifer Gap Rd. 

Vehicle was found in Dade County Ga 1 mile 59 SB. Yates towing towed the vehicle to 24 New England Dr Trenton Ga. Dade 
county is doing a recovery report

 
 

 
 

1814 E Main St20-026948 3/16/2020  11:47:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/16/2020 at 23:56 hours, Officer M. Recaido #965 was dispatched to 1814 E Main St. for an unknown 911. Upon arrival, I 
met with Mr. James Henderson who stated that he had been walking all day and was laying down now. I asked if he would like to 
go to the hospital or to Joe Johnson, he declined both offers and asked to be taken to Brainerd Rd. past the McCallie tunnel. I took
him to 3200 Brainerd Rd. and he went on his way. No further police action was taken.

1500 Arlington Ave20-026953 3/17/2020  12:42:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/17/2020 at 00:44 hours, I Officer Mulenga Teddy #894  observed a vehicle (2017 white Nissan altima )  run a 
red light traveling eastbound on wilcox blvd.

      I initiated a traffic stop at 1500 Arlington Ave. I made contact with the driver Demarcus Locklin. Demarcus stated that he was 
coming back from the store driving his girlfriend's vehicle when he ran the red light. Demarcus's  information came back negative 
for warrants and Demarcis gave consent to search the vehicle. Nothing was located. Nothing further follows.
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2528 Broad St20-026956 3/17/2020  12:10:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/17/2020 at 01:15 hours, Officer Lockhart,  Jennifer (68408) responded to a suspicious person at 2528 Broad St. at the 
Raceway.  Police make contact with a blue lifted F250 ( ) and the driver, Mr. John Hillman.  Mr. Hillman stated that he 
had been sitting there for awhile trying to decide what to do.  He said that he was sure if he needed to drive all the way home or if 
he needed to wait to see if his friend needed a ride.  Police verified that he did not have any active warrants.  Nothing further at this
time.

1330 E 3rd St20-026962 3/17/2020   2:21:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/17/2020 at 02:26 hours, Officer M. Dagostino (82257) responded to a suspicious activity at 1330 E 3rd St. The cashier at 
the Speedway reported a woman in her vehicle and wanted police to check on her. I made contact with this party who I identified 
as Ms. Roberts. Ms. Roberts reported she fell asleep and did not need medical attention. This call was closed with no further police
action needed. Nothing further to report.

311 Browns Ferry Rd20-026965 3/17/2020   2:56:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/17/2020 at 03:00 hours, I, Officer D. Schuerger #805 responded to suspicious activity at La Quinta 311  browns ferry Road, 
Chattanooga.

An Anonymous party called in stating that there were two males walking around the parking lot looking into vehicles. When I 
arrived on the scene, I located Andrew Shipley and Preston Proctor walking around the empty parking lot next door by the CVS. I 
asked both parties why they were out walking around. They stated that they could not sleep and they came outside for a walk to 
relax. They were released and went back to the hotel.

Officer Schuerger #805

8125 Cleveland Pike20-026968 3/17/2020   2:58:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 03/17/2020 at 03:12 hours, Officer Dyess (83681), I responded to a house fire at 8130 Old Cleveland Pike for a house fire. On 
arrival I observed a mobile home fully engulfed in flames. Fire arrived on scene and put out the fire. There is no information on the 
owner of the property at this time. Fire investigator has been contacted and will investigate further.

4109 15th Ave20-026972 3/17/2020   3:51:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/17/2020 at 04:00 hours, Officer Z. Tate (79893) reported a memo at 4109 15th Ave. Police arrived on scene and spoke to 
David Carter. Mr. Carter stated that while inside the above address he heard a call spin its tires outside the above address. When 
police arrived they found nothing out of the ordinary in the area. No further.

 
 
 
.

1815 E 26th St20-026986 3/17/2020   1:30:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle
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On 03/17/2020 at 11:17 hours, Officer King (78347) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 1815 E 26th 
St.  Police were dispatched to the 2100 block of E 4th St for a suspicious vehicle that had allegedly been sitting there since around 
0400 hours this morning.  When I arrived on scene I ran the tag and the vehicle showed as stolen.  I verified with dispatch that the 
vehicle was stolen they stated that it was.  The vehicle had heavy front end damage, a busted rear window on the passenger side 
and appeared to not be drivable.  There were no keys found with the vehicle.  NCIC contacted the victim and Police called 
Expressway Towing #1 to tow the vehicle.  I contacted the driver and informed them that the vehicle was being towed by 
Expressway Towing #1.

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 

 

l 
 
 

 

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd20-027069 3/17/2020  12:01:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 03/17/2020 at 13:00 hours, Officer S Martin (78348) responded to a Shoplifting at 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd.  Krista Shields - a 
loss prevention associate at Belks Men - alerted me to a shoplifting that occurred at approximately 1201  hours on 03/17/2020.  Ms. 
Shields showed me video footage of the incident.  The video footage revealed that an unknown male suspect selected an air fryer 
(valued at $199.99) and exited the store, passing all points-of-sale with paying for the merchandise.  The suspect got into the 
driver's seat of a vehicle and fled the scene.  The suspect vehicle appeared to be a silver Kia Forte with an illegible Tennessee 
license plate and a spare tire on the front passenger-side.  Pictures of the vehicle and suspect are attached to this report.  No 
further.

2000 Ruby St20-027093 3/17/2020   1:56:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/17/2020 at 13:56 hours, I Officer Wilcox #1036 initiated a traffic stop on a black Nissan with a passenger-side brake light out 
at 2000 Ruby St.  Upon making contact with driver Gabriel Jones, I explained the reason that he was pulled over. Mr. Jones stated 
that he was a Lyft driver and going to drop his passenger Troy Howard off at his destination. I got both occupants TN ID and ran 
them through NCIC, neither had an active warrant. While at the vehicle I could smell what I believed was marijuana. When I asked 
Mr. Jones he stated there was nothing in the vehicle and Mr. Howard stated that he was at a friend's house before he got in the 
vehicle. Both males consented to a search of their persons and the vehicle. Nothing was found. I gave a verbal warning to Mr. 
Jones for the brake light being out and explained to him to get it fixed or he may keep getting stopped. No further.
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1350 Interstate 75 Nb20-027120 3/17/2020   3:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/17/2020 at 15:52 hours, Officer Johnston (75394) reported a memo at 1350 Interstate 75 NB. On scene I spoke with Mr. 
Fowler who stated that he did not believe there to be any damage to his RV trailer at this time but would contact Police if he 
needed a report later on. He stated that a semi cut him off forcing him into the median where his truck and large RV trailer became 
stuck. Nothing else follows at this time.

1029 O Grady Dr20-027121 3/17/2020   3:51:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/17/2020 at 16:00 hours, Officer Mikel A. Thomas (71989) responded to a Well-Being Check at 1029 O Grady Dr. The 
complainant, Patricia Roberson, stated that she was trying to get in touch with her sister, Maryanne Cleveland, but was unable to 
get in contact with her. Upon arrival, I knocked on the door at the residence but did not get an answer at the door. The neighbor 
said that the residents were at work and that nothing seemed out of the ordinary. Police contacted the complainant and informed 
her that according to the neighbor, her sister was fine and well.

 

 

 

428 Booth Rd20-027184 3/17/2020   6:50:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 03/17/2020 at 19:10 hours, Officer Bell (79882) responded to a Property Found at 428 Booth Rd. Upon arrival, I spoke with Mr. 
Taylor who told me that his car had recently been stolen, and when he got it back, searched his vehicle. He told me that he found a
cell phone inside the vehicle, and just wanted to turn it in to Police. Phone was turned into property. No further action was needed.

603 Ashland Ter20-027196 3/17/2020   7:17:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/17/2020 at 19:22 hours, Officer Roberts, Galen (61098) reported a 'disorder' incident at 603 Ashland Ter./unit #10.  Upon 
arrival, police were unable to detect the presence of any active ado occurring. Chung Lang (complainant) owns the aforementioned
property and desired for a non-tenant (Stephanie Schoates) to vacate the premises. Stephanie Schoates gathered together most 
of her belongs and lawfully vacated Lang's property without incident.
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20 Cherokee Blvd20-027262 3/17/2020  11:30:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/17/2020 at 23:45 hours, Officer M Estock (82259) reported a suspicious activity at 20 Cherokee Blvd. Upon arrival, Officers 
made contact with Mr. Alex Browder. Mr. Browder informed officers he believed parties in the apartment above him had urinated 
off their apartment balcony into the street. Mr. Browder showed officers a portion of the sidewalk that was wet, which Mr. Browder 
stated to officers was urine. Officers asked Mr. Browder if he observed the upstairs parties urinating off the balcony. Mr. Browder 
stated he did not see the action take place and did not have suspect information. 

Officers attempted to make contact with parties residing in apartment , however, no contact was made. No further at this time.

8701 E Brainerd Rd20-027266 3/17/2020  11:36:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/17/2020 at 23:45 hours, Officer Puckett (61905) reported a memo at 8701  E Brainerd Rd. 
An anonymous complainant reported Mr. Moton as suspicious walking down E. Brainerd Rd. Upon making contact with Mr. Moton 
he was given a ride to East Lake Courts, because he did not have a ride.

3709 Carl White Pl20-027292 3/18/2020   1:53:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 01:55 hours, Officer Alexander Forgey (82278) reported a memo at 3709 Carl White Pl. 

Ms. Cameron stated she heard what she believed to be someone on her front porch near her door. Upon Police arrival, no one 
was located in the area and nothing appeared to be messed with. I spoke with Ms. Cameron and assured her that we checked the 
area and that no one was around the immediate area.

2938 Kings Point Rd20-027295 3/18/2020   2:00:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/18/2020 at 02:00 hours, Officer Harvey (66485) and Officer Pearson (84858) reported a memo at 2938 Kings Point Rd. 
During routine patrol police found a vehicle, Audi Sedan with a GA temporary tag/Test drive tag parked in an area that is was 
closed to the public at that time. In plain view inside the vehicle was a bullet proof vest with a "GT Distributors" sticker, a baseball 
cap with the words "SECURITY" on it, and a Asian style sword sheath. Police searched the area in attempt to find the vehicle 
owner but were unsuccessful. The VIN was checked in NCIC and returned not stolen.

951 Boynton Dr20-027303 3/18/2020   3:22:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 03:26 hours, Officer Lupo (63868) reported a memo at 951  Boynton Dr Apt 2186. Police responded to back up 
EMS & the Fire Department on a person that had fell down and could not get up. The fire department had to make a forced entry 
and was able to secure the door back afterward.

5716 Hwy 15320-027315 3/18/2020   4:13:00AM 91Z Field Interview
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On 3-18-20 around 04:13 hours I Ofc. Allison #237 was dispatched to 5716 Hwy 153 on a suspicious female in the area. The 
complainant was a clerk at the Murphys gas station who the suspicious female walking around the parking lot. I made contact with 
the female identified as Brittany Uren walking down the side of Hwy 153. Ms. Uren was intoxicated from consuming alcohol. She 
stated she lived in Lakesite with her mother. I transported Ms. Uren to her residence of 8975 Regent Lane along with another CPD 
Officer. Ms. Uren made it safely into her residence. Nothing further.

404 Tunnel Blvd20-027365 3/17/2020  10:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/18/2020 at 10:15 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 404 Tunnel Blvd. 

I spoke with Teresa Robinson by telephone.  She says that sometime after 2200 hours las night, an unknown party pulled down the
left side front window of her 2000 Buick Century, opened the trunk and stole her pack of toilet paper.

2476 Waterhaven Dr20-027366 3/18/2020   1:00:00AM 23H Theft of Watercraft

On 03/18/2020 at 10:22 hours, Officer Baker (79856) responded to a Theft of Watercraft at 2476 Waterhaven Dr.  I spoke with 
Mrs. Mays who stated that sometime last night someone cut a 2'x4' hole in her fence and stole a 17 foot canoe.  The canoe is 
green with a flat rear for mounting a motor.  It has a Florida registration placard number on it.  Nothing further at this time.

3005 Mary Walker Pl20-027398 3/18/2020  12:19:00PM 26C Impersonation

On 03/18/2020 at 12:12 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Impersonation at 3005 Mary Walker Pl. The victim said that 
she was just notified by Discover Card that someone had tried to take an account out with them in her name.  Also, she said a 
week ago, Office Depot called her about the same thing. She said that the accounts did not go through because there was a 
discrepancy in the address but she doesn't know what address was used and she said neither place would give her that info. She 
assumes the accounts were attempted online and she has no idea who is doing this. She said that she lost her wallet back in 
December of last year which contained her personal info. This report was taken by phone.

6414 E Brainerd Rd20-027404 3/18/2020  12:22:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 03/18/2020 at 12:16 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 6414 E Brainerd Rd. 

I spoke with Martishia Smith by telephone.  She says that while her car was at May's Brothers auto repair, TN  was 
stolen off of it.

The tag has been entered in NCIC # P787156704.

1709 Chickamauga Loop20-027414 3/18/2020  12:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 13:00 hours, Officer C. Darling reported a memo at 1709 Chickamauga Loop. Alaz Looper called and stated that 
he was involved in a traffic crash this morning (20- 027306). Mr. Looper stated that he was not on scene after the crash occurred 
while Police were conducting there investigation. Mr. Looper stated that he was the driver of the vehicle and was scared therefore 
he left the scene. Mr. Looper stated that he was confronted by a group of males and one of them pulled a gun on him. Mr. Looper 
stated that this is what caused him to get in his vehicle and leave Skyzoo quickly. Mr. Looper stated that he then pulled out of the 
parking lot and struck a pole. Mr. Looper stated that he was calling back in to see if he was needed for the original investigation 
(20- 027306). My supervisor and I were both unable to view the original report to determine what the investigating Officer 
determined or needed for his investigation. A phone call and email was sent to the investigating Officer to attempt to get additional 
information. At this time, all information found he is being forwarded to the investigating Officer. No further



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

2431 Bridge Cir20-027422 3/18/2020   1:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/18/2020 at 13:21  hours, Officer Baker (79856) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2431  Bridge Cir.  I spoke with 
Mrs. India who stated that someone stole 2 pairs of shoes and a gym bag from her vehicle overnight.  Mrs. India did not see any 
damage or signs of forced entry and isn't sure how they entered the vehicle.  Nothing further at this time.

1900 Anderson Ave20-027431 3/18/2020   2:20:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 03/18/2020 at 14:30 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of Chattanooga at 1900 
Anderson Ave. Police responded to the area to assist Car 541  with two stolen vehicles found. Upon arrival police verified the 2017 
Kia Forte had been reported stolen out of Red Bank  PD. Doug Yates responded on scene and towed the vehicle.

7421 Commons Blvd20-027441 3/16/2020  11:30:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/18/2020 at 15:01  hours, Officer Baker (79856) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 7421  Commons Blvd.  I spoke 
with Mrs. Kelly who stated that on Monday around noon someone took a 3 prong ball hitch of her F250.  Home Depot required that 
a police report be made in order to pull up video for possible suspects, nothing further at this time.

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd20-027447 3/18/2020   2:40:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 03/18/2020 at 14:40 hours, Officer Cabrera #513 responded to a Shoplifting at 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd. 

I was working an extra job at Dillards at Hamilton Place Mall. I received a phone call from loss prevention telling me they had a 
white male in the females store that stole a ring and a set of earrings. He was seen on video taking both items and stuffing them 
inside of his pocket and walking outside the store passing the last point of sale. The total cost for both items is $45. Nothing 
Further at this time.

6901 Lee Hwy20-027468 3/18/2020   3:37:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 15:39 hours, Officer Shelor Nicholas (78349) reported a memo at 6901  Lee Hwy. Police were on scene for a 
theft from vehicle and a party walked up to police about a found Mercedes key fob was found on the ground. I then took the key 
and turned it into property. No further.

271 Northgate Mall Dr20-027498 3/18/2020   4:55:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 03/18/2020 at 17:06 hours, Officer Simpson (83694) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 271  Northgate Mall Dr. Upon 
arrival, police met with Mr. Kimball. He stated that his vehicle was stolen by the passenger when he went into the mall to use the 
restroom. He stated the passenger was known as "NoLove" but he did not know her real name. He stated that she had asked to 
stay with him for a couple of days until she could find living arrangements. A bolo was created for the vehicle. The vehicle was 
entered into NCIC and searched for in the immediate area. No further police action could be conducted.

1605 S Watkins St20-027502 3/18/2020   5:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/18/2020 at 17:45 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a memo at 1605 S Watkins St. Police walked to a Maroon 
Suburban ( ) and it was occupied by two individuals fornicating in the back of the vehicle. Police identified both individuals 
as Ms. Cunningham and Mr. Delaney. Police asked to search the vehicle, the owner Mr. Delaney agree and allowed police to 
search. Police did not find anything of note in the vehicle. Nothing further.

1800 Mulberry St20-027511 3/18/2020   6:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 18:20 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a memo at 1800 Mulberry St.  Police saw and individual in a 
stairwell at Faith United Baptist Church. Police identified the individual as Ms. Roberts. Ms. Roberts said she was homeless and 
did not have ID to get into a shelter. Police told Ms. Roberts she needed to leave the area. Nothing Further.

1722 Jenkins Rd20-027531 3/18/2020   7:10:00PM 91Z Missing Person

Mr. Edge was located by Officer Petty.  He was removed from NCIC.  This case is closed Cleared Exceptionally.

3443 Mcnabb Way20-027538 3/18/2020   7:44:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/18/2020 at 19:47 hours, Officer Mark Livesay (79884) reported a memo at 3443 Mcnabb Way. Police responded to this 
location on a suspicious vehicle/person call where people were at an abandoned and condemned house taking things. Upon arriva
police made contact with the complainant, Ms. Shavers, who stated that no one was supposed to be there taking items and she 
saw people in the house loading things into a Nissan Versa car. Police searched the home and found no one in it. No one was in 
the vehicle either. Nothing further.

119 Hollyberry Ln20-027543 3/18/2020   7:55:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 20:00 hours, Officer Bell (79882) reported a memo at 119 Hollyberry Ln. Upon arrival I spoke with Ms. Thrush 
who told me that Mr. Pines had taken her phone and was refusing to give it back. I spoke with Mr. Pines who told me that Ms. 
Thrush had taken his phone, so he took hers. Both told me that they had gotten into a argument over some text messages. I told 
Mr. Pines to give the phone back to Ms. Thrush, and he then asked for his, which Ms. Thrush declined. I asked her if she had 
given the phone to him for him to use as his personal phone, and she told me that she had. I told her that since she had given the 
phone to him, for him to have, she could not take the phone back just because she was mad at him. She returned the phone to 
him, and both went their separate ways. No further action was needed.

7324 Shallowford Rd20-027544 3/18/2020   7:59:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 20:00 hours, Officer S.Long (79892) reported a memo at 7324 Shallowford Rd. Upon arrival, police made 
contact with a Mr. Robert Hayes. Mr. Hayes stated that he was calling police due to the fact that a coworker of his, Mr. Petre Liliac, 
was at his motel room trying to kick in his door. An anonymous tenant staying next door to Mr. Hayes stated that Mr. Hayes was 
exaggerating and that Mr. Liliac was just knocking on the door multiple times. Police found Mr. Liliac and he stated he was just 
trying to talk to Mr. Hayes but he wasn't coming to the door. Police made sure to inform both Mr. Liliac and Mr. Hayes to remain 
separated and avoid contact. No further.

818 Hooker Rd20-027548 3/18/2020   8:11:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/18/2020 at 20:25 hours, Officer Mikel A. Thomas (71989) responded to a Disorder at 818 Hooker Rd. The complainant, 
Violene Marsh, was calling for her sister, Jean Careathers, about her son, Demitrus Marsh. The complainant stated that her 
sister's son was beating and kicking on her front door wanting to come in but she did not want to let him in. When police arrived we
observed a black male standing at the front door leaning against the door. Police questioned him and asked him if he had 
identification to prove that he lived at that address. He stated that he did not have identification but he said he was Demitrus 
Marsh. Police had Marsh step away from the front door and we made contact with the complainant, her sister, and Donnell Marsh 
inside the residence. Careathers said that she did not want her son too come back to her house and that she wanted him 
trespassed. Police informed Demitrus that he was trespassed and that if he stepped one foot on the premises then he would be 
taken to jail. He then left the residence without incident.

 
 

 

 

2014 Gunbarrel Rd20-027607 3/18/2020  11:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 23:25 hours, Officer Veronica Thomas (75141) reported a memo at 2014 Gunbarrel Rd. Police were called for a 
well being check. Caller stated a male in a wheelchair was in the lane of travel. Upon arrival, I spoke to Mr. Lonnie Kaufman who 
stated he was crossing the street. Mr. Kaufman stated he dropped a bag and was trying to get it. He was also waiting on the bus. 
Mr. Kaufman stated to police that he was well and did not need any assistance. No further.

609 Ely Rd20-027608 3/18/2020   9:43:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/18/2020 at 22:30 hours, Officer Simpson (83694) reported a memo at 609 Ely Rd. Upon arrival, police met with Ms. Rogers. 
She stated that she attempted to report an auto theft earlier and it was never reported. I submitted an auto theft report and it was 
disapproved by Watson. The complaint number had already been used and an auto theft report was already done. 20-027357 was 
the original case.

   
 

 
 

 

 

7710 E Brainerd Rd20-027627 3/19/2020  12:47:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/19/2020 at 00:52 hours, Officer Puckett (61905) reported a memo at 7710 E Brainerd RD. 

I responded to a suspicious persons call and found Mr. Perez sitting in his car. Mr. Perez after further investigation was found to be
working security for the complex which started about 2 weeks ago.

1920 Robbins St20-027638 3/19/2020   1:17:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/19/2020 at 01:20 hours, Officer Cronon (82256) reported a memo at 1920 Robbins St. Upon arrival, Police spoke with Mr. 
Perkins, who stated he and his mother, Miss. Allen had gotten into a verbal argument. Mr. Perkins gathered his belongings and left
the premises. Miss. Allen stated she would like Mr. Perkins to be criminally trespassed from the residence. Mr. Perkins left the 
premises while police were still on scene. Nothing further to report at this time.

 
 

.

1008 Baldwin St20-027684 3/19/2020   7:47:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/19/2020 at 07:47 hours, Officer Moss, Mitchell N. (0060171) responded to 1008 Baldwin St. on an Abandoned Auto.  While 
on routine patrol I found the vehicle abandoned on location.  I personally stickered the vehicle as abandoned on 3-13-2020.  The 
vehicle was towed by Ault Towing on a district police pick-up.

884 Spindle Ct20-027702 3/18/2020   9:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/19/2020 at 09:43 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 884 Spindle Ct at the victim's 
home. The victim said that he last saw his vehicle (Chevy Suburban) last night around 9 pm and his son had just gotten a tool out 
of his tool bag in the back. The vehicle stayed there overnight and this morning around 6:30 am, he discovered that the bag was 
gone. He said there was no damage to the vehicle and he believes his son forgot to lock the rear door back when he got the tool 
out.  This report was taken by phone.

100 Manufacturers Rd20-027704 3/19/2020  10:15:00AM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 03/19/2020 at 10:30 hours, Officer D. Russell (63833) was dispatched to a theft at 100 Manufacturers Rd. Upon arrival I met 
with victim Samuel Needleham. Mr. Needleham is homeless in the area. Mr. Needleham stated that this morning a man on a bike 
stole is his green/yellow backpack that contained his phone. This happened at 100 Riverfront Pkwy. in the amphitheater. The 
phone is in a black and blue case and is valued at approx $200. Mr. Needleham did not have any other information regarding the 
phone. The witness Whitney McDurmin confirmed the facts of the days events.

 
 

271 Northgate Mall Dr20-027771 3/19/2020   1:14:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/19/2020 at 01:24 hours, Officer Veloz 603 reported a verbal disorder at 271  Northgate Mall Dr. Upon arrival to the scene I 
was informed by Tima Colle that the verbal disorder was over a cell phone charger and a wallet that was inside of her ex girlfriends
car. Her ex, named Tameya Jackson, was inside of her place of work and wouldn't let her have her stuff. I spoke with Tameya who 
eventually gathered the stuff up and provided it to me. I returned it to Tima and sent her on her way. Nothing more



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

6148 Lee Hwy20-027779 3/16/2020   3:00:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 03/19/2020 at 14:00 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 6148 Lee Hwy at One Park 
Place (Business Complex). The complainant said that she is the manager of the company that owns the complex and sometime 
between about 3 pm last Monday and 10:48 am this morning, the sign has been damaged there. She believes a vehicle may have 
hit it but she said there is no video or witness of the incident as far as she knows. She said that there are cameras at businesses 
across the street that may have caught it but she hasn't checked with them to see if there is any video at this time. She said that a 
portion of the bottom and side of the sign was torn out. Also, she said there was some white paint on it but no tire tracks or vehicle 
parts that would indicate it was done by a vehicle. There is no proof of how the damage was done or if it was intentional or 
accidental. She said that no estimate has yet been done for the sign. This report was taken by phone.

1330 East 3rd St20-027781 3/19/2020   2:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/19/2020 at 14:00 hours, Officer Charles Bramlett (66966) responded to a suspicious person at 1330 East 3rd St.  Upon 
arrival police spoke to the suspicious party who stated her name was Sommer Wilson.  Police checked and found Mrs. Wilson was 
not wanted for any outstanding warrants.  Mrs. Wilson called a friend, and when they arrived she left the area without further 
incident.  Nothing further to report.

 

 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

425 Shawnee Trl20-027836 3/19/2020   5:01:00PM 91Z Field Interview



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/19/2020 at 17:05 hours, Officer Brelsford (77566) reported a memo at 425 Shawnee Trl.

380 W Martin Luther King Blvd20-027843 3/19/2020   5:20:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/19/2020 at 17:25 hours, Officer Cleveland (62709) reported a memo at 380 W Martin Luther King Blvd. I got out with this 
433 party after a call came out about a w/m aggressive panhandler. This party was in a disorder with another person when I 
located him. I gathered his info and sent him on his way.

1512 S Holtzclaw Ave20-027859 3/19/2020   6:15:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/19/2020 at 18:22 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a memo at 1512 S Holtzclaw Ave. Police responded to an 
intoxicated party. The individual was identified as Mr. Kelley. Mr. Kelley appeared intoxicated. Mr. Kelley was slurring his speech 
and his eyes was glazed over. Mr. Bennecke who is over the Rescue Mission said he does not want Mr. Kelley back on the 
property due to disorderly behavior more then once. Mr Kelley was told not to come back to the Rescue Mission by Police. Mr. 
Kelley is trespassed from this property for one year starting on this date.  Nothing Further.

3210 Wilcox Blvd20-027899 3/19/2020   8:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/19/2020 at 20:00 hours, Officer M. Dagostino (82257) conducted a field interview at 3210 Wilcox Blvd. While at this location 
I observed a woman on her phone who looked to be extremely worried. I spoke with this party that I identified as Ms. Christy 
Mitchell who informed me she got a call from an IRS office stating that they were going to take out warrants on her. I informed this 
party that it was an ongoing scam nationwide and she had nothing to worry about. I spoke to the supposed IRS employee who 
identified himself as Eric Shaw this party had a very thick accent that sounded consistent with a middle eastern or Indian accent. 
When I  informed them I was a police officer they immediately hung up the phone. The number this call originated from was 

 from Columbia, MD. Nothing further to report.

200 Riverside Ave20-027903 3/19/2020   8:10:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/19/2020 at 20:15 hours, Officer Luke Simon 971  responded to a broken down auto at 200 Riverside Ave. Upon arrival I 
observed a semi-truck and trailer stuck in the middle of Riverside Ave. I observed the rear driver's side tires of the semi-truck 
slightly off the roadway. I was informed by the driver, Mr Hargrove, the trailer was empty. Mr Hargrove stated he had to stop when 
the trailer got stuck on the tire. Prior to my arrival Mr Hargrove had contacted a tow company to come and assist him in further 
movement of his vehicle. No damages were caused to Mr Hargrove's semi-truck, the trailer or any of the surrounding property.

181 Interstate 24 W20-027906 3/19/2020   8:19:00PM 91Z Fire

On 03/19/2020 at 20:25 hours, Officer Ryan Lynn (73508) responded to a Fire at 181  Interstate 24 W. Upon arrival, I spoke with 
victim J Bourque. JB stated he was driving when he began experiencing mechanical issues. After he was able to pull to the side of 
the roadway, his vehicle ignited. CFD responded to the scene to extinguish the fire. No injuries were reported at the scene.

2004 E 14th St20-027934 3/19/2020   9:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/19/2020 at 22:00 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a memo at 2004 E 14th St. Police spoke with Mr. Beck who said 
that two homeless people have been staying in his vehicles behind his house. Police went to the back of Mr. Beck's house and saw
a white male sleeping in a truck. Police identified the male as Mr. Tackett. Mr. Tackett said he was homeless and was waiting on 
his girlfriend Charollette. Mr. Beck does not want Mr. Tackett on his property again. Police told Mr. Tackett not to come back to the 
property. Mr. Tackett is trespassed from the property. Nothing Further.



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

99 Walnut St20-027951 3/19/2020  10:30:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/19/2020 at approximately 22:50 hours, Officer M Estock (82259) reported a memo at 99 Walnut St. Upon arrival Officer 
made contact with parties on the bridge they heard gun fire towards the center of the bridge. Officers walked down the bridge and 
where parties stated the loud noise was backfire from vehicles parked underneath Market St Bridge. Officer made contact with 
parties underneath Market St Bridge and confirmed they were backfiring their vehicles. They apologized. No further.

 
 

1709 Anderson Ave20-027960 3/19/2020   9:30:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 03/19/2020 at 23:10 hours, Officer Ayres (82234) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 1709 Anderson Ave.   Upon arrival 
I spoke with Clayton Owens.  Mr. Owens stated at approximately 2130 hrs. on the above date, Mr. Owens parked his vehicle, a 
2013 Ford Fusion (TN  on the street in front of the above address.  Mr. Owens stated he returned outside to get in 
his vehicle at approximately 2215 hrs. on the above date and notice his vehicle was no longer in the parking spot where he last left 
it.  Mr. Owens stated the keys were with his vehicle.  Mr. Owens stated additional identifying characteristics of his vehicle included 
dark window tint and a Pittsburgh Steelers rear license plate frame.  Mr. Owens estimated the value of his vehicle to be 
approximately $15,000.  Mr. Owens stated his TN Drivers License was also left in the vehicle.  Mr. Owens stated he did not give 
anyone permission to use his vehicle and requested it to be entered in as stolen.  Mr. Owens vehicle was entered into NCIC as 
stolen with NIC #: V361857375.

No further action was taken for this incident.

7301 E Brainerd Rd20-027965 3/19/2020  11:19:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/19/2020 at 23:21  hours, Officer Puckett (61905) reported a memo at 7301  E Brainerd Rd. 

I responded to a noise complaint on the above date and time and found Ms. Parrish playing loud music in her vehicle. A records 
check was conducted nothing further.

 
 
 

 



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

428 Oliver St20-027985 3/20/2020  12:30:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 03/20/2020 at 00:43 hours, Officer E Buckman (66981) and Officer C Gross (84850) reported to a suspicious activity at 428 
Oliver St. Police spoke with Ms. Kelly Rastatter who stated that while driving home she noticed he neighbors vehicles driver side 
door was open and the interior light was on and she thought someone had rifled through it. Ms. Rastatter stated that she did not 
have any suspect information. Police then spoke with the vehicle owner (Tripp Davis) who stated that he did not hear anyone going
through the vehicle. Mr. Davis searched the vehicle but did not notice anything was taken. No further police action required.

 
 
 

1105 Arlington Ave20-027990 3/20/2020   1:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/20/2020 at 01:05 hours, Officer Ziegler (83701) reported a memo at 1105 Arlington Ave. Ms. Austin stated that a black 
female threatened to kill her because she did not believe in Jesus. A little while later, the suspect was outside. Police spoke with 
the suspect who stated that she was inside with her babies and cousin while she heard a disorder outside. She heard people 
yelling that they were going to call the police to have them kicked off the property. Ms. Hunter was then free to leave. No further 
police action was taken.

3909 Hoyt St20-028000 3/20/2020   1:17:00AM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 03/20/2020 at 01:17 hours, Officer Joshua Blaine Price (76315) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of 
Chattanooga at 3909 Hoyt St. While on Patrol, Police got behind a white coupe (TN ). The vehicle showed stolen. Police 
checked the status with dispatch and my ALPR system showed a positive hit for Stolen.  Police continued to follow behind the 
vehicle waiting for extra units. Police attempted a traffic stop at the intersection of Hoyt St. and Tunnel Blvd. The vehicle failed to 
stop and left the area on Hoyt St. The roads in this area are Dead Ends. While Police were in the area the vehicle was located 
empty and still running at the end of Hoyt St.  Police checked the area and no one was located. The owner (Brenton Ledford) was 
contacted and responded to the scene. Vehicle was removed from NCIC and released to the owner. Vehicle was driven from the 
scene.
The vehicle was stolen from Hamilton County OCN #20-007235.

731 Mansion Cir20-028005 3/20/2020   1:25:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/20/2020 at 13:08 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 731  
Mansion Cir. 

Mr. Simon called in top add his Apple Ipad with serial number.

 
 

 
  

2109 Lynnbrook Ave20-028062 3/20/2020   8:44:00AM 91Z Property Lost



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/20/2020 at 08:34 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Property Lost at 2109 Lynnbrook Ave at Quality Engines 
shop. The victim said that he last saw the tag on his vehicle about 3 months ago while it was at Quality Engines having work done 
on it. Since then, he said the vehicle has been taken to 2 other shops and about a month ago, he discovered that the tag was 
gone. He's not sure if it was lost or stolen. This report was taken by phone.  Vehicle Info: 1984 Chevy Monte Carlo,  , 
VIN/1G1AZ37G1ER177876

4514 Hixson Pike20-028066 3/20/2020   8:47:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/20/2020 at 08:32 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 4514 Hixson Pike. 

I spoke with Michael Grimes by telephone.  He says that he left his 2001  Toyota Tacoma on the lot of Enterprise Rent-A-Car over 
night.  He says that when he returned this morning, he found that an unknown party(s) had attempted to steal his vehicle.  He says 
that the dash was damaged and wires cut.   He says that the unknown was unable to steal the vehicle, but did steal all of his tools 
that he had in the attached tool box.  He says that the box was pried open, and damaged.

Mr. Grimes says that he will prepare a list of all items taken and email that list as soon as possible.

870 Vine St20-028079 3/20/2020   9:49:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/20/2020 at 09:33 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 870 Vine St. 

I spoke with Melanie Schaefer by telephone.  She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party entered her unlocked 
2013 Honda Civic and stole her debit card.  She says that she has since that time canceled the card.

Miss Schaefer says that her debit card was used for $1.00 at Mapco # 3532, at 0231  hours this morning.  She had no further 
information to add to the report.

2502 Ivy St20-028090 3/19/2020   8:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/20/2020 at 10:06 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2502 Ivy St. 

I spoke with Florence Stanley by telephone.  She says that last evening she was carrying in packages and forgot and left her 2006 
Volvo unlocked.  She says that an unknown party entered the vehicle and stole her purse and all of its contents.

Ms. Stanley stated that she stayed up most of the night canceling the credit and debit cards.

On 03/20/2020 at 12:38 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2502 Ivy 
St. The victim needed to add some cash that was in the stolen purse. This new info was taken by phone.

1305 W 45th St20-028091 3/19/2020   5:30:00PM 91Z Property Lost

On 03/20/2020 at 10:23 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Property Lost at 1305 W 45th St at the victim's home. The 
victim said that he received the new sticker (tag decal) for his vehicle yesterday by mail and he last saw it around 5:30 pm. This 
morning around 8:30 am, he discovered it was gone and he believes it was thrown away by accident. This report was taken by 
phone.   For Vehicle: 1999 Isuzu Trooper 

1 E 11th St20-028109 3/20/2020  11:45:00AM 13B Simple Assault

On 03/23/2020 at 06:08 hours, Officer Dorman (75380) talked to Danny Burney on the phone regarding his checks being delayed 
at 1 E 11th St at Patton Towers. He informed police that he was involved in an incident a few days ago regarding this ongoing 
issue. Mr. Burney wanted to inform police that he suspects Ms. Nichole Cameron of being responsible for delaying his checks off 
and on for the past 5 years. Mr. Burney informed police that he was given medication earlier this week and still has his medication. 
Police informed him to avoid all contact with Nichole Cameron. If his checks continue to be delayed he should talk to another 
representative other than Cameron to resolve the issue. Nothing further to report.



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

2230 Mccallie Ave20-028123 3/20/2020  12:03:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 03/20/2020 at 12:03 hours, Officer R. Ballard (60157) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 2230 Mccallie Ave. Upon 
arrival, I spoke with Roy Brooks. (Possible consumer heath person) Mr. Brooks reported a b/m reach in the front pockets of his 
pants and took $25.00 dollars from him. Mr. Brooks reported this occurred while he was at the bus stop. Mr. Brooks also stated 
last week a b/m reached into his front pockets and took $5.00 dollars from him. No further information at this time.

 
 

 

1007 E 32nd St20-028129 3/20/2020   1:06:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 03/20/2020 at 12:30 hours, Officer Thomas (78350) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of Chattanooga at 1007 
E 32nd St. Police responded to the above address for a possible stolen vehicle. Police were able to confirm the vehicle as stolen. 
Owners were notified. United Wrecker came and towed the vehicle. Vehicle was removed from NCIC as stolen. V641827475. No 
suspect information.

 
 
 

 
  

  
 

 

4793 Adams Rd20-028166 3/20/2020   9:30:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 03/20/2020 at 14:31  hours, Officer Veloz 603 responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 4793 Adams Rd. Upon arrival to the 
scene I was greeted by the victim named Chad Wallace. Mr. Wallace informed me that at 0930hrs this morning a maroon in color 
Saturn drove into the parking lot of Flywheel, pulled next to his vehicle, and proceeded to take an AMP from his vehicle. The video 
footage shows the vehicle driving into the parking lot and what appears to be targeting Mr. Wallace's vehicle. The unknown 
suspect gets out of the car and walks around Mr. Wallace's car opens the driver side door (which can't lock) and then opens the 
trunk and dissembles the amp. Then the vehicle slowly drives off. Mr. Wallace did not recognize the vehicle but from the footage. 
Nothing else was taken from the vehicle. Mr. Wallace is going to try to gather the S/N information to provide at a later time. Nothing 
further.



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

 

 

 
 

 
 

3400 Rossville Blvd20-028199 3/20/2020   4:15:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/20/2020 at 16:25 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a memo at 3400 Rossville Blvd. Police spoke with Mr. Born who 
said an acquaintance of his Mr. Bosworth tried to take his bicycle. Mr. Born said he prevented Mr. Bosworth from taking it. Mr. Born
wanted Police to document that Mr. Bosworth tried to take the bicycle. No further Police action was required. Nothing further.

928 Signal Mountain Rd20-028218 3/20/2020   5:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/20/2020 at 17:08 hours, Officer Luke Simon 971  responded to a possible medical emergency at 928 Signal Mountain Rd. 
While responding officers were informed of a white sedan occupied by one male party who was asleep or "passed out" in the 
center lane going north on Signal Mountain Rd just south of Suck Creek Rd. Officers got in the area, but were unable to locate the 
vehicle. Fire also appeared to be unable to locate any vehicles matching this description or location. No further calls were received 
on this at the time of this report.

2727 Rossville Blvd20-028219 3/20/2020   5:30:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 03/20/2020 at 17:40 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) responded to a Shoplifting at 2727 Rossville Blvd. Police spoke with Mr. 
Peters the manager at the Mapco. Mr. Peters said a black female came into the store and went to the beer section. Mr. Peters said 
the female put two beers and a bag of chips in her jacket then walked to the bathroom. Mr. Peters said the female left bathroom 
and went out the door. Mr. Peters said he tried to stop the female from leaving but was unable to. The female left the scene in a 
Red Ford ). Mr. Peters told Police he checked the bathroom and did not see the items in there. No further suspect 
information is available at this time. Nothing Further.

123 Cedar Ln20-028229 3/20/2020  11:38:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/20/2020 at 17:40 hours, Officer Dropp (675) responded to a Miscellaneous Complaint at 123 Cedar Ln. Officers made 
contact with Ms. Kristi McCormick. Ms. McCormick stated that she had been driving a semi-truck ) to Atlanta for 
her employer. She stated that while she was on her way back, she was told that her employer may have reported the semi as 
stolen. Ms. McCormick wanted police to respond to the scene to verify if the truck was reported stolen, and to ensure that police 
were aware that she had not stolen it and had been authorized to use it and that it was returned to the lot. Officers verified the tag 
and VIN of the truck, and it did not appear to be reported as stolen at this time. No further police action was taken.



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

 
 

 
 

1812 S Holtzclaw Ave20-028245 3/20/2020   6:36:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/20/2020 at 18:45 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) reported a memo at 1812 S Holtzclaw Ave. Police spoke with Mr. Tyson 
who said Mr. Davidson had broken the rules of the Rescue Mission. Mr. Tyson said he wants Mr. Davidson to leave the property. 
Police told Mr. Davidson that he needs to leave the property and not come back. Mr. Davidson left the property without incident. 
Nothing Further.

7312 Shallowford Rd20-028253 3/20/2020   6:54:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/20/2020 at 19:04 hours, Officer S.Long (79892) reported a memo at 7312 Shallowford Rd. Police were dispatched on a 
suspicious party call at the Wyngate Hotel. Police were informed from the manager of Wyngate that a female in a silver Hyundai 
was causing issues, is not a guest, and needed to leave. I found the female in question and identified her to be a Ms. Susan 
Stokes. Ms. Stokes stated she had someone there communicating on her behalf for a room to rent. There was no one else around 
or on the property that fit the narrative Ms. Stokes had given me. I informed Ms. Stokes that the business did not wish to rent her a 
room at this time and she needed to leave and she did. No further at this time.

8325 Hickory Valley Rd20-028261 3/20/2020   6:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/20/2020 at 18:44 hours, Officer Shelor Nicholas (78349) reported a memo at 8325 Hickory Valley Rd. Police responded to a 
single vehicle accident in the rain and met with the complainant Mr. William Grant. He said that his vehicle hydroplaned and he hit 
the dirt on the opposite side of the road. He said that he was okay and did not need medical attention or a police report. He then 
got his vehicle out of the roadway and waited for a tow truck. No further.

4900 Brainerd Rd20-028267 3/20/2020   7:50:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 03/20/2020 at 20:00 hours, Officer E. Lee (885) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 4900 Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival I  
was met by the complainant Mr. Gavin Langston, which stated he couldn't find his wallet when he arrived home from the gas 
station at the stated location. Mr. Langston stated he looked everywhere for the wallet and was unable to find it. Mr. Langston 
stated someone has his wallet because someone has tried to use his credit card for an online purchase since he left the gas 
station originally. Mr. Langston stated the wallet valued at $20 dollars and contained a TN Id, social security card, and two bank 
cards. No suspect information at this time.

3800 Highland Ave20-028291 3/20/2020   9:33:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/20/2020 at 21:33 hours I, Officer Wolff #1006 was traveling south on Alton Park Blvd when I observed a silver sedan cross 
the double yellow line while changing lanes. I initiated my emergency equipment for a traffic stop at 3800 Highland Ave. Upon 
approach of the vehicle's passenger side I spoke with Mr. Tavius Caffey. A warrant out of Georgia showed for Mr. Caffey however 
it was non extraditable. Mr. Caffey was given a verbal warning for the traffic infraction. Nothing further at this time.

1755 Gunbarrel Rd20-028318 3/20/2020  11:49:00PM 91Z Field Interview



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/20/2020 at 23:51  hours, Officer Puckett (61905) reported a memo at 1755 Gunbarrel Rd. 

I responded to Erlanger East hospital and found Mr. Delvalle needed a ride home. He was transported to Whispering Pines on Lee 
Hwy Lot 41  and met at the door by his mother. No incident occurred.

4713 Bonny Oaks Dr20-028354 3/21/2020   2:13:00AM 91Z All Other Traffic Offenses

On 03/24/2020 at 11:19 hours, Officer Hamilton (66984) wrote a continuation/supplement for a All Other Traffic Offenses at 4713 
Bonny Oaks Dr. Laurel Ridge apartments property manager, Krishna Hennessee, needed to add property damage to the initial 
report from this incident. Ms. Hennessee stated that the iron fencing on the Redlands dr side of the property was damaged due to 
the vehicle the driving crashing into it. She stated that the approximate damage to the property fence is $2500. There is nothing 
further to report.

2200 Morris Hill Rd20-028376 3/21/2020   6:53:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/21/2020 at 06:55 hours, Officer Puckett (61905) reported a memo at 2200 Morris Hill Rd. 

On above date and approximate time I responded to the above address on a possible traffic crash. Upon arrival I observed a 
vehicle on the side of the road that had slid in the mud, but did not appear to make impact with anything nor did it have a driver 
present. At the present time it is out of the roadway and does not impact traffic  flow or public safety. Vehicle was left for owner to 
retrieve.

2212 Polymer Dr20-028396 3/21/2020   9:20:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/21/2020 at 09:30 hours, Officer C. Darling reported a memo at 2212 Polymer Dr. (Public Storage). Tonya West Yanik 
(Manager) stated that David Catchings and Sarah Creekmore needed to vacate the property due to a break in the agreement 
paperwork. Ms. Yanik stated that the two were caught sleeping in a storage unit on the property thus violating the agreement. The 
two were notified by Police to vacate the property by 1700 hours on this date due to the violation. Both parties agreed to gather 
there belongings and leave prior to 1700 hours. No further

4700 N Terrace20-028443 3/21/2020  12:12:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 03/21/2020 at 12:12 hours, Officer Davis (61886) reported a memo at 4700 N Terrace. while on routine patrol I observed Mr 
Collier sitting down on the exit ramp from I-24 west to S Moore Road holding a card board sign in front of him pan handling. Mr 
Collier was on the left side of the roadway clearly on the exit ramp itself. Mr Collier was given a verbal warning and told further 
police action could take place if he returns. Nothing further.

4767 58 Hwy20-028446 3/21/2020   1:05:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/21/2020 at 12:25 hours, Officer Hamilton (66984) reported a memo at 4767 58 Hwy. Upon arrival I spoke with complainant 
Steven Rowe. Mr. Rowe wanted to report that while he was picking up roadway trash behind Armando's an unknown W/F came 
out of Armando's and began to cuss him out. There is nothing further to report.

1801 W Polymer Dr20-028448 3/21/2020  12:30:00PM 91Z Property Found



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/21/2020 at 12:35 hours, Officer C. Darling responded to a Property Found at 1801  W Polymer Dr. Police arrived on scene 
and was taken to a vehicle that had a little bit of shake of Marijuana in the vehicle. It was located in the center console of the 
vehicle loose and barley enough to collect. The little amount of Marijuana was vacuumed up and no longer accessible to anyone in
the public. No further

6392 Cheswick Rd S20-028466 3/18/2020   8:00:00AM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 03/21/2020 at 13:30 hours, Officer McCall (0062872) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 6392 Cheswick Rd S. Officer 
McCall called and spoke to the victim Roy Bratton over the phone. Mr. Bratton said that several days ago he had fraudulent 
charges on his Region's Bank card. Mr. Bratton said that one of those charges was for $700 worth of concert tickets from 
StubHub. Mr. Bratton said Region's Bank has since taken care of that issue for him. Mr. Bratton said he was in contact with a 
business claiming to be out of Atlanta, GA. Mr. Bratton said this company told him if he would go and purchase Apple itune gift 
cards, they would do a sting to catch whoever it was that did the fraudulent charges. Mr. Bratton said he made several purchases 
of Apple itune gift cards in the amount of $1,100 and gave this company the numbers on the back. The fake company said they 
needed him to purchase more gift cards, to which Mr. Bratton said he would need to see results from them before purchasing 
more. Mr. Bratton said once he told them he was calling police they hung up on him. Mr. Bratton said there was also a charge of 
$500 to a Zelle Transaction. Mr. Bratton said the people he talked to sounded legit and that they knew what they were talking 
about. Officer McCall has seen this fraud before in which they get people to purchase gift cards and get the account numbers off of
them.

3404 Amnicola Hwy20-028470 3/20/2020   3:00:00PM 91Z Property Lost

On 03/21/2020 at 13:47 hours, Officer Mayweather (61094) responded to a Property Lost at 3404 Amnicola Hwy. I made contact 
by phone with Mr. Frank Gore of U.S. Nuclear Reglatory Commission that one of his agents lost his belt badge hear in 
Chattanooga while he was on assignment here. No further action taken.

5773 Brainerd Rd20-028488 3/21/2020   2:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/21/2020 at 14:45 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 5773 Brainerd Rd. Police went inside the Mexi Wings 
and let them know that they could not have any dine ins, only carryout. Police spoke with Perez Facio who stated that they are 
doing carry out only. No further.

5579 Hwy 15320-028495 3/20/2020  12:05:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 03/21/2020 at 09:30 hours, I (FTO Clemons #827) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 5579 Hwy 153. While conducting 
a follow up investigation for a theft of credit cards under complaint number 20-028146, I discovered that the credit cards stolen 
from the victim (2 CY12 Visa cards, and a Capital 1 Master Card) had been used at the Target at this location. They were used to 
attempt to purchase gift cards in amounts of $1,000, $1,000, and $576.46. I responded to the target and observed surveillance 
footage of a light skinned, possibly middle eastern, male wearing a blue and green jacket, light colored baseball hat, and gray 
sweat pants. The party is seen at a register attempting to purchase gift cards in excess of $1,000 before he leaves the store and 
walks away from the parking lot on foot. These purchases were confirmed by the victim, Jennifer Rutherford through her bank. 
Nothing further to report.

 

 



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

 
 

 

4811 Bellbrook Dr20-028543 3/21/2020   6:00:00PM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 03/21/2020 at 18:15 hours, Officer K. Thomas (80763) responded to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 4811  
Bellbrook Dr. Police spoke with complainant / victim Ms. Sharon Stewart, who stated that she was a recent victim of fraud through 
Ebay. Ms. Stewart stated that she listed her wedding dress for sale on the Ebay site and stated that a party by the name of Pamela
Taylor (Ebay User Name: Trinket Delinquent), contacted her wanting to buy the dress. Ms. Stewart stated that she had the dress 
listed for 150, and that the buyer requested that Ms. Stewart overnight it to her, which would cost an additional 83, bringing the tota
to 220. Ms. Stewart stated that she agreed and shipped the dress to the buyer at 2229 NW 79th Ave. Miami, FL 33122 Suite: 
89775331. Ms. Stewart stated that the money she was supposed to be paid never made it's way to her Paypal account, and that 
she received a message stating that "the limit amount was not reached" and that she needed to pay more money in order for that 
limit to be reached. Ms. Stewart stated that she was requested to purchase 500 in Ebay gift cards and send it to a specific place, 
but informed the party that she did not have that much money, that all she had left to her name was 50. The party stated that would
be okay, and the info was sent. It is unclear at this time who the gift cards were sent to. Ms. Stewart stated that she filed a report 
with Paypal and Ebay. Suspect info is available below:

960 Airport Rd20-028548 3/21/2020   6:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/21/2020 at 18:44 hours, Officer Dropp (675) reported a memo at 960 Airport Rd. Officers were dispatched to this location for 
a Disorder. Upon arrival officers made contact with Natasha Jackson, an employee. Ms. Jackson stated that a female came into 
the bus station and began cussing at her and other customers for no reason, and then left the scene. Ms. Jackson told officers that 
if the female (described as wearing blue jeans, blue jacket, and a purple bag) was located in the nearby area, she wanted her 
trespassed from the property. Officers were unable to locate any party matching this description in the surrounding area. Nothing 
further to report.

2431 Williams St20-028551 3/21/2020   6:48:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/21/2020 at 18:50 hours, Officer Mikel A. Thomas (71989) responded to a disorder at 2431  Williams St. Upon arrival I saw a 
black truck parked in front of the Red Roof Inn entrance and a black male standing to the left of the entrance of the hotel. Police 
found this person to be Cameron Denton. Police questioned him and he stated that he and his girlfriend, Brittney Boyd, had gotten 
into an argument. Brittney was sitting in the truck and Cameron wanted her out of his truck and to go inside the hotel. After 
speaking to Brittney she got out of the vehicle and went inside while Cameron left the premises to go to a friends house so the 
situation would calm down.

160 Highway 27 Sb20-028560 3/21/2020   7:36:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 03/21/2020 at 19:43 hours, Officer Avila (80755) reported a memo at 160 Highway 27 SB. Police observed an abandoned 
vehicle in the roadway on highway 27 Sb. The vehicle appeared to have been wrecked however there was no one in or around the 
vehicle. Due to the vehicle being a road hazard it was towed from the scene by Cains wrecker to their lot.

312 Mcbrien Rd20-028567 3/21/2020   8:04:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



3/16/2020  12:39:32AM TO 3/21/2020  11:59:32PM

On 03/21/2020 at 20:10 hours, Officer E. Lee (885) responded to a disorder at 312 Mcbrien Rd Apt 422. Upon arrival, I heard a 
loud argument occurring in the  apartment building of 312 Mcbrien Rd. I made contact with the individuals that were in a 
argument at apt . They stated it was only a verbal disorder over nothing. The two parties in a verbal disorder were identified as 
Jordan Torrence and Nicholas Torrence. There were no signs of a physical altercation and both parties stated the argument was 
over. Nothing further.

812 W 13th Street Ct20-028633 3/21/2020  11:51:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 03/22/2020 at 00:01  hours, Officer R. Petty (75408) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 812 W 13th Street Ct. Upon my 
arrival, I spoke with Devida Bone and Taya Coleman. Bone stated they were dropping some stuff of at Coleman's apartment and 
when they came back out her vehicle was gone. She stated she left it sitting on the curb in front off the apartment for no more than 
thirty minutes. Coleman stated they left the keys in the car by accident. Both parties are unsure of who stole the vehicle and in 
what direction it went.  

Attempts were made to locate vehicle, nothing was found at the moment. Vehicle was put into NCIC. NIC#V721888804

On 03/22/2020 at 14:56 hours, I Officer Franks (68395) responded to a stolen auto call at Orchard Knob and Walker Ave. The RP 
Mrs. Devida Bone was following the stolen vehicle with a friend. I made contact with Mrs. Bone shortly after she had lost sight of 
the vehicle and said the driver lost them around the East Dale Area. Nothing further to report at this time.

7544 Leemont Dr20-028992 3/21/2020   8:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 03/23/2020 at 09:40 hours, Officer William Bernitt (77564) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 7544 Leemont Dr.  
Upon arrival police spoke with Charles Holmes who stated the parking area to a duplex he owns had been destroyed.  Police 
observed a large section of concrete that had sunken down into the earth and broken and cracked.  Mr. Holmes stated an 
estimation of damage was around $2000.  Nothing further.

959 Boynton Dr20-029015 3/20/2020   6:00:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 03/23/2020 at 11:14 hours, Officer Baker (79856) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 959 Boynton Dr.  I spoke with Mr. 
James who stated that sometime between 1800 on 03/20/2020 and 0900 03/23/2020 a Rigid Pipe Threading machine was stolen 
from the work site at 959 Boynton Dr.  The unit is a Rigid 300 Compact, gray in color on a black folding stand with orange cutters.  
Photo of an example of the unit is included in this report, nothing further at this time.




